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Bible Greek and Hebrew Dictionaries combined for Word Studies 

abundance 2123 ## ziyz {zeez}; from an unused root apparently meaning to be conspicuous; fulness of the breast; also 
a moving creature: -- {abundance}, wild beast. 

beast 2123 ## ziyz {zeez}; from an unused root apparently meaning to be conspicuous; fulness of the breast; also a 
moving creature: -- abundance, wild {beast}. 

besom 4292 ## mat&ate& {mat-at-ay'}; apparently a denominative from 2916; a broom (as removing dirt [compare 
Engl. "to dust", i.e. remove dust]): -- {besom}. 

creepeth 7431 ## remes {reh'-mes}; from 7430; a reptile or any other rapidly moving animal: -- that {creepeth}, 
creeping (moving) thing. 

creeping 7431 ## remes {reh'-mes}; from 7430; a reptile or any other rapidly moving animal: -- that creepeth, 
{creeping} (moving) thing. 

moving 2796 # kinesis {kin'-ay-sis}; from 2795; a stirring: -- {moving}. 

moving 5205 ## niyd {need}; from 5110; motion (of the lips in speech): -- {moving}. 

moving 7431 ## remes {reh'-mes}; from 7430; a reptile or any other rapidly moving animal: -- that creepeth, creeping 
({moving}) thing. 

removing 1473 ## gowlah {go-law'}; or (shortened) golah {go-law'}; active participle feminine of 1540; exile; 
concretely and collectively exiles: -- (carried away), captive(-ity), {removing}. 

removing 3331 # metathesis {met-ath'-es-is}; from 3346; transposition, i.e. transferral (to heaven), disestablishment 
(of a law): -- change, {removing}, translation. 

that 7431 ## remes {reh'-mes}; from 7430; a reptile or any other rapidly moving animal: -- {that} creepeth, creeping 
(moving) thing. 

thing 7431 ## remes {reh'-mes}; from 7430; a reptile or any other rapidly moving animal: -- that creepeth, creeping 
(moving) {thing}. 

wild 2123 ## ziyz {zeez}; from an unused root apparently meaning to be conspicuous; fulness of the breast; also a 
moving creature: -- abundance, {wild} beast. 



Hebrew and Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the definitions plus 
combined with every place that word is used in the definitions. 

Complete index of every word used in both the Hebrew and Greek Strong's 
Dictionary in English Word order. 

moving 01709 ## dag {dawg} ; or (fully) da'g (Nehemiah 13 : 16) {dawg} ; from 01711 ; a fish (as prolific) ; or perhaps 
rather from 01672 (as timid) ; but still better from 01672 (in the sense of squirming , i . e . {moving} by the vibratory 
action of the tail) ; a fish (often used collectively) : -- fish . 

moving 02123 ## ziyz {zeez} ; from an unused root apparently meaning to be conspicuous ; fulness of the breast ; also 
a {moving} creature : -- abundance , wild beast . 

moving 05205 ## niyd {need} ; from 05110 ; motion (of the lips in speech) : -- {moving} . 

moving 07431 ## remes {reh'- mes} ; from 07430 ; a reptile or any other rapidly moving animal : -- that creepeth , 
creeping ({moving}) thing . 

moving 07431 ## remes {reh'- mes} ; from 07430 ; a reptile or any other rapidly {moving} animal : -- that creepeth , 
creeping (moving) thing . 

moving 2796 - kinesis {kin'-ay-sis}; from 2795; a stirring: -- {moving}. 

removing 01473 ## gowlah {go-law'} ; or (shortened) golah {go-law'} ; active participle feminine of 01540 ; exile ; 
concretely and collectively exiles : -- (carried away) , captive (- ity) , {removing} . 

removing 04292 ## mat'ate'{mat-at-ay'} ; apparently a denominative from 02916 ; a broom (as {removing} dirt 
[compare Engl . " to dust " , i . e . remove dust ]) : -- besom . 

removing 3331 - metathesis {met-ath'-es-is}; from 3346; transposition, i.e. transferral (to heaven), disestablishment 
(of a law): -- change, {removing}, translation. 



Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.

2796 + for the moving +/ . kinesis {kin'-ay-sis}; from 2795 + not move + and move + was moved + were moved + him 
wagging + on him wagging + and will remove + fellow and a mover +/ ; a stirring: --moving . 

3331 + a change + the removing + his translation +/ . metathesis {met-ath'-es-is}; from 3346 + over + removed + men 
turning + being changed + had translated + was translated + And were carried +/ ; transposition, i .e . transferral (to 
heaven), disestablishment (of a law): --change, removing, translation . 



Root Words and their word stems. This helps you see all related words in 
the English. 

5 - moving 



English Theasurus that shows all the ways the English word is translated 
from the original Greek and Hebrew. 

moving 2796 ** kinesis ** {moving}.

moving 5205 -- niyd -- {moving}.

moving 7431 remes -- -- that creepeth, creeping ({moving}) thing.

removing 1473 -- gowlah -- (carried away), captive(-ity), {removing}.

removing 3331 ** metathesis ** change, {removing}, translation.



Greek Cross References that shows all the ways the Greek is translated from 
the English word. 

moving 2796 kinesis * {moving} , {2796 kinesis } ,

removing 3331 metathesis * {removing} , {3331 metathesis } ,



English to Hebrew and Greek Thesaurus

The - is marking the Old Testament words. The * is marking the New Testament Words. English list 
of words is 15,684 * Hebrew Numbers refered to 8,674 * Greek Numbers refered to 5,624 * Unique 
English words in N.T. 5,437 * Unique English words in O.T. 10,254 

* moving , 2796 ,

- moving , 5205 , 7169 , 7430 , 8318 ,

- removing , 1473 , 5493 ,

* removing , 3331 ,



English Synonyms with Greek Strong's Number.

moving - 2796 {moving},

removing - 3331 change, {removing}, translation,



One Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the moving creature that hath life, and 
fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the green herb have I given 
you all things.

moving 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving of my lips should asswage 
[your grief].

moving 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting for the 
moving of the water.

moving 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he bringeth evil to pass.

removing 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, and remove by day in their 
sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will consider, though they 
[be] a rebellious house.

removing 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff for removing: and thou 
shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the speckled and spotted 
cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: and [of such] shall be 
my hire.

removing 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of those things that are shaken, 
as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing I have lost my 
children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I was left 
alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



Two Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving creature 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the moving creature that hath 
life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving his 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he bringeth evil to pass.

moving of 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving of my lips should asswage 
[your grief].

moving of 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting for the 
moving of the water.

moving thing 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the green herb have I 
given you all things.

removing and 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, and remove by day in 
their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will consider, though 
they [be] a rebellious house.

removing and 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff for removing: and 
thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing from 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the speckled and 
spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: and [of such] 
shall be my hire.

removing of 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of those things that are 
shaken, as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing to 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing I have lost my 
children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I was left 
alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



Three Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving creature that 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the moving creature that 
hath life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving his lips 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he bringeth evil to 
pass.

moving of my 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving of my lips should 
asswage [your grief].

moving of the 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting for the 
moving of the water.

moving thing that 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the green herb 
have I given you all things.

removing and remove 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, and remove by 
day in their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will consider, 
though they [be] a rebellious house.

removing and thou 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff for removing: 
and thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing from thence 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the speckled 
and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: and [of 
such] shall be my hire.

removing of those 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of those things that are 
shaken, as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing to and 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing I have lost 
my children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I was left 
alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



Four Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving creature that hath 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the moving creature 
that hath life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving his lips he 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he bringeth evil to 
pass.

moving of my lips 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving of my lips should 
asswage [your grief].

moving of the water 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting 
for the moving of the water.

moving thing that liveth 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the green 
herb have I given you all things.

removing and remove by 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, and remove 
by day in their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will consider, 
though they [be] a rebellious house.

removing and thou shalt 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff for 
removing: and thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing from thence all 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the 
speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: 
and [of such] shall be my hire.

removing of those things 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of those things 
that are shaken, as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing to and fro 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing I have 
lost my children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I was 
left alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



Five Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving creature that hath life 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the moving 
creature that hath life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving his lips he bringeth 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he 
bringeth evil to pass.

moving of my lips should 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving of my lips 
should asswage [your grief].

moving of the water 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting 
for the moving of the water.

moving thing that liveth shall 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the 
green herb have I given you all things.

removing and remove by day 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, and 
remove by day in their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will 
consider, though they [be] a rebellious house.

removing and thou shalt go 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff for 
removing: and thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing from thence all the 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the 
speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: 
and [of such] shall be my hire.

removing of those things that 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of those 
things that are shaken, as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing to and fro and 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing I 
have lost my children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I 
was left alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



Six Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving creature that hath life and 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the moving 
creature that hath life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving his lips he bringeth evil 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he 
bringeth evil to pass.

moving of my lips should asswage 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving of 
my lips should asswage [your grief].

moving of the water 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting 
for the moving of the water.

moving thing that liveth shall be 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the 
green herb have I given you all things.

removing and remove by day in 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, and 
remove by day in their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will 
consider, though they [be] a rebellious house.

removing and thou shalt go forth 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff 
for removing: and thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing from thence all the speckled 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence 
all the speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the 
goats: and [of such] shall be my hire.

removing of those things that are 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of those 
things that are shaken, as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing to and fro and who 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing 
I have lost my children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, 
I was left alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



Seven Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

moving creature that hath life and fowl 01_GEN_01_20 # And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the 
moving creature that hath life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven.

moving his lips he bringeth evil to 20_PRO_16_30 # He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: moving his lips he 
bringeth evil to pass.

moving of my lips should asswage your 18_JOB_16_05 # [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the moving 
of my lips should asswage [your grief].

moving of the water 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting 
for the moving of the water.

moving thing that liveth shall be meat 01_GEN_09_03 # Every moving thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as 
the green herb have I given you all things.

removing and remove by day in their 26_EZE_12_03 # Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for removing, 
and remove by day in their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they 
will consider, though they [be] a rebellious house.

removing and thou shalt go forth at 26_EZE_12_04 # Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as 
stuff for removing: and thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity.

removing from thence all the speckled and 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from 
thence all the speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled 
among the goats: and [of such] shall be my hire.

removing of those things that are shaken 58_HEB_12_27 # And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the removing of 
those things that are shaken, as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain.

removing to and fro and who hath 23_ISA_49_21 # Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, 
seeing I have lost my children, and am desolate, a captive, and removing to and fro? and who hath brought up these? 
Behold, I was left alone; these, where [had] they [been]?



English Concordance to the KJV Bible.

moving , 01_GEN_01_20 , 01_GEN_09_03 ,

moving , 18_JOB_16_05 ,

moving , 20_PRO_16_30,

moving , 43_JOH_05_03 ,

removing , 01_GEN_30_32,

removing , 23_ISA_49_21,

removing , 26_EZE_12_03 , 26_EZE_12_04 ,

removing , 58_HEB_12_27,
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Bible Phrases for Individual word studies 

moving creature 01_GEN_01_20 

moving his lips he bringeth evil 20_PRO_16_30 

removing from thence all 01_GEN_30_32 



Bible Quick Find Phrase Concordance for fast finding of phrases

moving ^ 01_GEN_01_20 / moving /^creature that hath life, and fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open 
firmament of heaven. 

moving ^ 20_PRO_16_30 / moving /^his lips he bringeth evil to pass. 

moving ^ 18_JOB_16_05 / moving /^of my lips should asswage [your grief]. 

moving ^ 43_JOH_05_03 / moving /^of the water. 

moving ^ 01_GEN_09_03 / moving /^thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the green herb have I given you 
all things. 

removing ^ 26_EZE_12_03 / removing /^and remove by day in their sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to 
another place in their sight: it may be they will consider, though they [be] a rebellious house. 

removing ^ 26_EZE_12_04 / removing /^and thou shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into 
captivity. 

removing ^ 01_GEN_30_32 / removing /^from thence all the speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle 
among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: and [of such] shall be my hire. 

removing ^ 58_HEB_12_27 / removing /^of those things that are shaken, as of things that are made, that those things 
which cannot be shaken may remain. 

removing ^ 23_ISA_49_21 / removing /^to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I was left alone; these, 
where [had] they [been]? 



Bible Translation Phrases for Individual word studies 

moving ......... for the moving 2796 -kinesis-> 

removing ......... the removing 3331 -metathesis-> 



Bible Word Index with the full text of each verse

moving 01_GEN_01_20 And God said, Let the waters bring forth abundantly the {moving} creature that hath life, and 
fowl [that] may fly above the earth in the open firmament of heaven. 

moving 01_GEN_09_03 Every {moving} thing that liveth shall be meat for you; even as the green herb have I given 
you all things. 

moving 18_JOB_16_05 [But] I would strengthen you with my mouth, and the {moving} of my lips should asswage 
[your grief]. 

moving 43_JOH_05_03 In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, waiting for the 
{moving} of the water. 

moving 20_PRO_16_30 He shutteth his eyes to devise froward things: {moving} his lips he bringeth evil to pass. 

removing 09_1SA_49_21 Then shalt thou say in thine heart, Who hath begotten me these, seeing I have lost my 
children, and am desolate, a captive, and {removing} to and fro? and who hath brought up these? Behold, I was left 
alone; these, where [had] they [been]? 

removing 26_EZE_12_03 Therefore, thou son of man, prepare thee stuff for {removing}, and remove by day in their 
sight; and thou shalt remove from thy place to another place in their sight: it may be they will consider, though they 
[be] a rebellious house. 

removing 26_EZE_12_04 Then shalt thou bring forth thy stuff by day in their sight, as stuff for {removing}: and thou 
shalt go forth at even in their sight, as they that go forth into captivity. 

removing 01_GEN_30_32 I will pass through all thy flock to day, {removing} from thence all the speckled and spotted 
cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among the goats: and [of such] shall be 
my hire. 

removing 58_HEB_12_27 And this [word], Yet once more, signifieth the {removing} of those things that are shaken, 
as of things that are made, that those things which cannot be shaken may remain. 



Bible Word Index with Strong's Number with the full text of each verse

moving ^ 43_JOH_05_03 In <1722> these <5025> lay <2621> (5711) a great <4183> multitude <4128> of impotent 
folk <0770> (5723), of blind <5185>, halt <5560>, withered <3584>, waiting for <1551> (5740) the {moving} <2796> 
of the water <5204>. 

removing ^ 58_HEB_12_27 And <1161> this word, Yet <2089> once more <0530>, signifieth <1213> (5719) the 
{removing} <3331> of those things that are shaken <4531> (5746), as <5613> of things that are made <4160> (5772), 
that <2443> those things which cannot <3361> be shaken <4531> (5746) may remain <3306> (5661). 



Bible Word Index with Strong's Number 

Language Tranliteration of original language words

moving 01_GEN_01_20 . And God (00430 +)elohiym ) said (00559 +)amar ) , Let the waters (04325 +mayim ) bring 
(08317 +sharats ) forth (08317 +sharats ) abundantly (08317 +sharats ) the {moving} (08318 +sherets ) creature 
(08318 +sherets ) that hath life (02416 +chay ) , and fowl (05775 +(owph ) [ that ] may fly (05774 +(uwph ) above 
(05921 +(al ) the earth (00776 +)erets ) in the open (06440 +paniym ) firmament (07549 +raqiya( ) of heaven (08064 
+shamayim ) . 

moving 01_GEN_09_03 Every (03605 +kol ) {moving} (07430 +ramas ) thing that liveth (02416 +chay ) shall be meat 
(00402 +)oklah ) for you ; even as the green (03418 +yereq ) herb (06212 +(eseb ) have I given (05414 +nathan ) you 
all (03605 +kol ) things . 

moving 18_JOB_16_05 [ But ] I would strengthen (00553 +)amats ) you with my mouth (06310 +peh ) , and the 
{moving} (05205 +niyd ) of my lips (08193 +saphah ) should asswage (02820 +chasak ) [ your grief ] . 

moving 43_JOH_05_03 In these (5025 -tautais -) lay (2621 -katakeimai -) a great (4183 -polus -) multitude (4128 -
plethos -) of impotent (0770 -astheneo -) folk , of blind (5185 -tuphlos -) , halt (5560 -cholos -) , withered (3584 -xeros -
) , waiting (1551 -ekdechomai -) for the {moving} (2796 -kinesis -) of the water (5204 -hudor -) . 

removing 26_EZE_12_03 Therefore , thou son (01121 +ben ) of man (00120 +)adam ) , prepare (06213 +(asah ) thee 
stuff (03627 +k@liy ) for {removing} (01473 +gowlah ) , and remove (01540 +galah ) by day (03119 +yowmam ) in 
their sight (05869 +(ayin ) ; and thou shalt remove (01540 +galah ) from thy place (04725 +maqowm ) to another 
(00312 +)acher ) place (04725 +maqowm ) in their sight (05869 +(ayin ):it may be they will consider (07200 +ra)ah ) , 
though (03518 +kabah ) they [ be ] a rebellious (04805 +m@riy ) house (01004 +bayith ) . 

removing 26_EZE_12_04 Then shalt thou bring (03318 +yatsa) ) forth (03318 +yatsa) ) thy stuff (03627 +k@liy ) by 
day (03119 +yowmam ) in their sight (05869 +(ayin ) , as stuff (03627 +k@liy ) for {removing} (01473 +gowlah ):and 
thou shalt go (03318 +yatsa) ) forth (03318 +yatsa) ) at even (06153 +(ereb ) in their sight (05869 +(ayin ) , as they 
that go (04161 +mowtsa) ) forth (04161 +mowtsa) ) into captivity (01473 +gowlah ) . 

removing 01_GEN_30_32 I will pass (05674 +(abar ) through all (03605 +kol ) thy flock (06629 +tso)n ) to day (03117 
+yowm ) , {removing} (05493 +cuwr ) from thence (08033 +sham ) all (03605 +kol ) the speckled (05348 +naqod ) and 
spotted (02921 +tala) ) cattle (07716 +seh ) , and all (03605 +kol ) the brown (02345 +chuwm ) cattle (07716 +seh ) 
among the sheep (03775 +keseb ) , and the spotted (02921 +tala) ) and speckled (05348 +naqod ) among the goats 
(05795 +(ez ):and [ of such ] shall be my hire (07937 +shakar ) . 

removing 58_HEB_12_27 And this (3588 -ho -) [ word ] , Yet (2089 -eti -) once (0530 -hapax -) more , signifieth (1213 -
deloo -) the {removing} (3331 -metathesis -) of those (3588 -ho -) things that are shaken (4531 -saleuo -) , as of things 
that are made (4160 -poieo -) , that those (3588 -ho -) things which cannot (3361 -me -) be shaken (4531 -saleuo -) may 
remain (3306 -meno -) . 

removing 23_ISA_49_21 Then shalt thou say (00559 +)amar ) in thine heart (03824 +lebab ) , Who (04310 +miy ) hath 
begotten (03205 +yalad ) me these (00428 +)el - leh ) , seeing I have lost (07908 +sh@kowl ) my children , and am 
desolate (01565 +galmuwd ) , a captive (01473 +gowlah ) , and {removing} (05493 +cuwr ) to and fro ? and who (04310 
+miy ) hath brought (01431 +gadal ) up these (02007 +hennah ) ? Behold (02005 +hen ) , I was left (07604 +sha)ar ) 
alone (00905 +bad ) ; these (00428 +)el - leh ) , where (00375 +)eyphoh ) [ had ] they [ been ] ? 

things:moving 20_PRO_16_30 He shutteth (06095 +(atsah ) his eyes (05869 +(ayin ) to devise (02803 +chashab ) 
froward (08419 +tahpukah ) {things:moving} (07169 +qarats ) his lips (08193 +saphah ) he bringeth (03615 +kalah ) 
evil (07451 +ra( ) to pass (03615 +kalah ) . 
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