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affection 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; 
by implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself 
in (with concern or obedience): -- set the {affection} on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let 
this) mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

authority 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise {authority} upon, bring under the 
(have) power of. 

authority 2715 # katexousiazo {kat-ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 2596 and 1850; to have (wield) full privilege over: --
exercise {authority}. 

be 1467 # egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468; to exercise self-restraint (in diet and 
chastity): -- can([-not]) contain, {be} temperate. 

be 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- {be} bold, X boldly, have confidence, 
be confident. Compare 5111. 

be 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- be bold, X boldly, have confidence, 
{be} confident. Compare 5111. 

be 3421 # mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420; to exercise memory, i.e. recollect; by 
implication to punish; also to rehearse: -- make mention; {be} mindful, remember. 

be 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + {be} of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

be 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, ({be}) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

be 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + {be} of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

be 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), ({be} like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

be 5431 # phrontizo {fron-tid'-zo}; from a derivative of 5424; to exercise thought, i.e. be anxious: -- {be} careful. 

bold 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- be {bold}, X boldly, have 
confidence, be confident. Compare 5111. 

boldly 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- be bold, X {boldly}, have 
confidence, be confident. Compare 5111. 

bring 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority upon, {bring} under the (have) 
power of. 

can 1467 # egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468; to exercise self-restraint (in diet and 
chastity): -- {can}([-not]) contain, be temperate. 

care 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) {care}(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

careful 5431 # phrontizo {fron-tid'-zo}; from a derivative of 5424; to exercise thought, i.e. be anxious: -- be {careful}. 

compassion 3627 # oikteiro {oyk-ti'-ro}; also (in certain tenses) prolonged oiktereo {oyk-ter-eh'-o}; from oiktos (pity); 
to exercise pity: -- have {compassion} on. 

confidence 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- be bold, X boldly, have 
{confidence}, be confident. Compare 5111. 

confident 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- be bold, X boldly, have 
confidence, be {confident}. Compare 5111. 

consider 3539 # noieo {noy-eh'-o}; from 3563; to exercise the mind (observe), i.e. (figuratively) to comprehend, heed: 
-- {consider}, perceive, think, understand. 

contain 1467 # egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468; to exercise self-restraint (in diet and 
chastity): -- can([-not]) {contain}, be temperate. 

despitefully 5195 # hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to exercise violence, i.e. abuse: -- use {despitefully}, reproach, 
entreat shamefully (spitefully). 

entreat 5195 # hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to exercise violence, i.e. abuse: -- use despitefully, reproach, 
{entreat} shamefully (spitefully). 

exercise 1128 # gumnazo {goom-nad'-zo}; from 1131; to practise naked (in the games), i.e. train (figuratively): --
{exercise}. 

exercise 1129 # gumnasia {goom-nas-ee'-ah}; from 1128; training, i.e. (figuratively) asceticism: -- {exercise}. 

exercise 1497 ## gazal {gaw-zal'}; a primitive root; to pluck off; specifically to flay, strip or rob: -- catch, consume, 
{exercise} [robbery], pluck (off), rob, spoil, take away (by force, violence), tear. 

exercise 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- {exercise} authority upon, bring under the 
(have) power of. 

exercise 1980 ## halak {haw-lak'}; akin to 3212; a primitive root; to walk (in a great variety of applications, literally 
and figuratively): -- (all) along, apace, behave (self), come, (on) continually, be conversant, depart, + be eased, enter, 
{exercise} (self), + follow, forth, forward, get, go (about, abroad, along, away, forward, on, out, up and down), + 
greater, grow, be wont to haunt, lead, march, X more and more, move (self), needs, on, pass (away), be at the point, 
quite, run (along), + send, speedily, spread, still, surely, + tale-bearer, + travel(-ler), walk (abroad, on, to and fro, up 
and down, to places), wander, wax, [way-]faring man, X be weak, whirl. 

exercise 2634 # katakurieuo {kat-ak-oo-ree-yoo'-o}; from 2596 and 2961; to lord against, i.e. control, subjugate: --
{exercise} dominion over (lordship), be lord over, overcome. 

exercise 2715 # katexousiazo {kat-ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 2596 and 1850; to have (wield) full privilege over: --
{exercise} authority. 

exercise 2961 # kurieuo {ko-ree-yoo'-o}; from 2962; to rule: -- have dominion over, lord, be lord of, {exercise} 
lordship over. 

exercise 4160 # poieo {poy-eh'-o}; apparently a prolonged form of an obsolete primary; to make or do (in a very wide 
application, more or less direct): -- abide, + agree, appoint, X avenge, + band together, be, bear, + bewray, bring 
(forth), cast out, cause, commit, + content, continue, deal, + without any delay, (would) do(-ing), execute, {exercise}, 
fulfil, gain, give, have, hold, X journeying, keep, + lay wait, + lighten the ship, make, X mean, + none of these things 
move me, observe, ordain, perform, provide, + have purged, purpose, put, + raising up, X secure, shew, X shoot out, 
spend, take, tarry, + transgress the law, work, yield. Compare 4238. 

exercise 6031 ## `anah {aw-naw'}; a primitive root [possibly rather ident. with 6030 through the idea of looking down 
or browbeating]; to depress literally or figuratively, transitive or intransitive (in various applications, as follows): --
abase self, afflict(-ion, self), answer [by mistake for 6030], chasten self, deal hardly with, defile, {exercise}, force, 
gentleness, humble (self), hurt, ravish, sing [by mistake for 6030], speak [by mistake for 6030], submit self, weaken, 
X in any wise. 

exercise 6213 ## `asah {aw-saw'}; a primitive root; to do or make, in the broadest sense and widest application (as 
follows): -- accomplish, advance, appoint, apt, be at, become, bear, bestow, bring forth, bruise, be busy, X certainly, 
have the charge of, commit, deal (with), deck, + displease, do, (ready) dress(-ed), (put in) execute(-ion), {exercise}, 
fashion, + feast, [fight-]ing man, + finish, fit, fly, follow, fulfill, furnish, gather, get, go about, govern, grant, great, + 
hinder, hold ([a feast]), X indeed, + be industrious, + journey, keep, labour, maintain, make, be meet, observe, be 
occupied, offer, + officer, pare, bring (come) to pass, perform, pracise, prepare, procure, provide, put, requite, X 
sacrifice, serve, set, shew, X sin, spend, X surely, take, X thoroughly, trim, X very, + vex, be [warr-]ior, work(-man), 
yield, use. 

have 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority upon, bring under the ({have}) 
power of. 

have 2292 # tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to exercise courage: -- be bold, X boldly, {have} 
confidence, be confident. Compare 5111. 

have 3627 # oikteiro {oyk-ti'-ro}; also (in certain tenses) prolonged oiktereo {oyk-ter-eh'-o}; from oiktos (pity); to 
exercise pity: -- {have} compassion on. 

let 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + {let} this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

like- 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be {like-}, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

make 3421 # mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420; to exercise memory, i.e. recollect; by 
implication to punish; also to rehearse: -- {make} mention; be mindful, remember. 

mention 3421 # mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420; to exercise memory, i.e. recollect; by 
implication to punish; also to rehearse: -- make {mention}; be mindful, remember. 

mind 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
{mind}(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

mindful 3421 # mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420; to exercise memory, i.e. recollect; by 
implication to punish; also to rehearse: -- make mention; be {mindful}, remember. 

not 1467 # egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468; to exercise self-restraint (in diet and 
chastity): -- can([{-not}]) contain, be temperate. 

of 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority upon, bring under the (have) 
power {of}. 

of 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be {of} the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

of 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be {of} one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

on 3627 # oikteiro {oyk-ti'-ro}; also (in certain tenses) prolonged oiktereo {oyk-ter-eh'-o}; from oiktos (pity); to 
exercise pity: -- have compassion {on}. 

on 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection {on}, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

one 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of {one}, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

oppress 2616 # katadunasteuo {kat-ad-oo-nas-tyoo'-o}; from 2596 and a derivative of 1413; to exercise dominion 
against, i.e. oppress: -- {oppress}. 

perceive 3539 # noieo {noy-eh'-o}; from 3563; to exercise the mind (observe), i.e. (figuratively) to comprehend, heed: 
-- consider, {perceive}, think, understand. 

power 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority upon, bring under the (have) 
{power} of. 

regard 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), {regard}, savour, think. 

remember 3421 # mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420; to exercise memory, i.e. recollect; by 
implication to punish; also to rehearse: -- make mention; be mindful, {remember}. 

reproach 5195 # hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to exercise violence, i.e. abuse: -- use despitefully, {reproach}, 
entreat shamefully (spitefully). 

same 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the {same}, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

savour 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, {savour}, think. 

set 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- {set} the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

shamefully 5195 # hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to exercise violence, i.e. abuse: -- use despitefully, reproach, 
entreat {shamefully} (spitefully). 

spitefully 5195 # hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to exercise violence, i.e. abuse: -- use despitefully, reproach, 
entreat shamefully ({spitefully}). 

temperate 1467 # egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468; to exercise self-restraint (in diet 
and chastity): -- can([-not]) contain, be {temperate}. 

the 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority upon, bring under {the} (have) 
power of. 

the 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of {the} same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

the 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set {the} affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

think 3539 # noieo {noy-eh'-o}; from 3563; to exercise the mind (observe), i.e. (figuratively) to comprehend, heed: --
consider, perceive, {think}, understand. 

think 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, {think}. 

this 5426 # phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by 
implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself in 
(with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let {this}) 
mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

under 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority upon, bring {under} the (have) 
power of. 

understand 3539 # noieo {noy-eh'-o}; from 3563; to exercise the mind (observe), i.e. (figuratively) to comprehend, 
heed: -- consider, perceive, think, {understand}. 

upon 1850 # exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- exercise authority {upon}, bring under the (have) 
power of. 

use 5195 # hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to exercise violence, i.e. abuse: -- {use} despitefully, reproach, entreat 
shamefully (spitefully). 



Hebrew and Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the definitions plus 
combined with every place that word is used in the definitions. 

Complete index of every word used in both the Hebrew and Greek Strong's 
Dictionary in English Word order. 

exercise 01497 ## gazal {gaw-zal'} ; a primitive root ; to pluck off ; specifically to flay , strip or rob : -- catch , 
consume , {exercise} [robbery ] , pluck (off) , rob , spoil , take away (by force , violence) , tear . 

exercise 01980 ## halak {haw-lak'} ; akin to 03212 ; a primitive root ; to walk (in a great variety of applications , 
literally and figuratively) : -- (all) along , apace , behave (self) , come , (on) continually , be conversant , depart , + be 
eased , enter , {exercise} (self) , + follow , forth , forward , get , go (about , abroad , along , away , forward , on , out , 
up and down) , + greater , grow , be wont to haunt , lead , march , X more and more , move (self) , needs , on , pass 
(away) , be at the point , quite , run (along) , + send , speedily , spread , still , surely , + tale-bearer , + travel (- ler) , 
walk (abroad , on , to and fro , up and down , to places) , wander , wax , [way-] faring man , X be weak , whirl . 

exercise 06031 ## ` anah {aw-naw'} ; a primitive root [possibly rather ident . with 06030 through the idea of looking 
down or browbeating ] ; to depress literally or figuratively , transitive or intransitive (in various applications , as 
follows) : -- abase self , afflict (- ion , self) , answer [by mistake for 06030 ] , chasten self , deal hardly with , defile , 
{exercise} , force , gentleness , humble (self) , hurt , ravish , sing [by mistake for 06030 ] , speak [by mistake for 
06030 ] , submit self , weaken , X in any wise . 

exercise 06213 ## ` asah {aw-saw'} ; a primitive root ; to do or make , in the broadest sense and widest application (as 
follows) : -- accomplish , advance , appoint , apt , be at , become , bear , bestow , bring forth , bruise , be busy , X 
certainly , have the charge of , commit , deal (with) , deck , + displease , do , (ready) dress (- ed) , (put in) execute (-
ion) , {exercise} , fashion , + feast , [fight-] ing man , + finish , fit , fly , follow , fulfill , furnish , gather , get , go about , 
govern , grant , great , + hinder , hold ([a feast ]) , X indeed , + be industrious , + journey , keep , labour , maintain , 
make , be meet , observe , be occupied , offer , + officer , pare , bring (come) to pass , perform , pracise , prepare , 
procure , provide , put , requite , X sacrifice , serve , set , shew , X sin , spend , X surely , take , X thoroughly , trim , 
X very , + vex , be [warr-] ior , work (- man) , yield , use . 

exercise 08323 ## sarar {saw-rar'} ; a primitive root ; to have (transitively , {exercise} ; reflexively , get) dominion : --
X altogether , make self a prince , (bear) rule . 

exercise 1128 - gumnazo {goom-nad'-zo}; from 1131; to practise naked (in the games), i.e. train (figuratively): --
{exercise}. 

exercise 1129 - gumnasia {goom-nas-ee'-ah}; from 1128; training, i.e. (figuratively) asceticism: -- {exercise}. 

exercise 1271 - dianoia {dee-an'-oy-ah}; from 1223 and 3563; deep thought, properly, the faculty (mind or its 
disposition), by implication, its {exercise}: -- imagination, mind, understanding. 

exercise 1467 - egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468; to {exercise} self-restraint (in diet 
and chastity): -- can( [-not]) contain, be temperate. 

exercise 1850 - exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849; to control: -- {exercise} authority upon, bring under the 
(have) power of. 

exercise 2292 - tharrheo {thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293; to {exercise} courage: -- be bold, X boldly, have 
confidence, be confident. Compare 5111. 

exercise 2480 - ischuo {is-khoo'-o}; from 2479; to have (or {exercise}) force (literally or figuratively): -- be able, avail, 
can do( [-not]), could, be good, might, prevail, be of strength, be whole, + much work. 

exercise 2616 - katadunasteuo {kat-ad-oo-nas-tyoo'-o}; from 2596 and a derivative of 1413; to {exercise} dominion 
against, i.e. oppress: -- oppress. 

exercise 2634 - katakurieuo {kat-ak-oo-ree-yoo'-o}; from 2596 and 2961; to lord against, i.e. control, subjugate: --
{exercise} dominion over (lordship), be lord over, overcome. 

exercise 2715 - katexousiazo {kat-ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 2596 and 1850; to have (wield) full privilege over: --
{exercise} authority. 

exercise 2961 - kurieuo {ko-ree-yoo'-o}; from 2962; to rule: -- have dominion over, lord, be lord of, {exercise} 
lordship over. 

exercise 3421 - mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420; to {exercise} memory, i.e. recollect; by 
implication to punish; also to rehearse: -- make mention; be mindful, remember. 

exercise 3539 - noieo {noy-eh'-o}; from 3563; to {exercise} the mind (observe), i.e. (figuratively) to comprehend, 
heed: -- consider, perceive, think, understand. 

exercise 3627 - oikteiro {oyk-ti'-ro}; also (in certain tenses) prolonged oiktereo {oyk-ter-eh'-o}; from oiktos (pity); to 
{exercise} pity: -- have compassion on. 

exercise 4160 - poieo {poy-eh'-o}; apparently a prolonged form of an obsolete primary; to make or do (in a very wide 
application, more or less direct): -- abide, + agree, appoint, X avenge, + band together, be, bear, + bewray, bring 
(forth), cast out, cause, commit, + content, continue, deal, + without any delay, (would) do(-ing), execute, {exercise}, 
fulfil, gain, give, have, hold, X journeying, keep, + lay wait, + lighten the ship, make, X mean, + none of these things 
move me, observe, ordain, perform, provide, + have purged, purpose, put, + raising up, X secure, shew, X shoot out, 
spend, take, tarry, + transgress the law, work, yield. Compare 4238. 

exercise 4395 - propheteuo {prof-ate-yoo'-o}; from 4396; to foretell events, divine, speak under inspiration, 
{exercise} the prophetic office: -- prophesy. 

exercise 5195 - hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196; to {exercise} violence, i.e. abuse: -- use despitefully, reproach, 
entreat shamefully (spitefully). 

exercise 5426 - phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to {exercise} the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; 
by implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to interest oneself 
in (with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let 
this) mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

exercise 5431 - phrontizo {fron-tid'-zo}; from a derivative of 5424; to {exercise} thought, i.e. be anxious: -- be careful. 

exercised 1139 - daimonizomai {dahee-mon-id'-zom-ahee}; middle voice from 1142; to be {exercised} by a daemon: --
have a (be vexed with, be possessed with) devil(-s). 

exercised 1654 - eleemosune {el-eh-ay-mos-oo'-nay}; from 1656; compassionateness, i.e. (as {exercised} towards the 
poor) beneficence, or (concretely) a benefaction: -- alms(-deeds). 

exercises 4342 - proskartereo {pros-kar-ter-eh'-o}; from 4314 and 2594; to be earnest towards, i.e. (to a thing) to 
persevere, be constantly diligent, or (in a place) to attend assiduously all the {exercises}, or (to a person) to adhere 
closely to (as a servitor): -- attend (give self) continually (upon), continue (in, instant in, with), wait on (continually). 



Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.

0778 + do I exercise +/ . askeo {as-keh'-o}; probably from the same as 4632 + sail + vessel + vessels + a vessel + his 
goods + any vessel + one vessel + his vessel + the vessels + and his stuff + and the vessel + as the vessels + manner 
vessels + it with a vessel + he shall be a vessel +/ ; to elaborate, i .e . (figuratively) train (by implication, strive): --
exercize . 

0779 + bottles + the bottles + and the bottles + out and the bottles +/ . askos {as-kos'}; from the same as 0778 + do I 
exercise +/ ; a leathern (or skin) bag used as a bottle: --bottle . 

1128 + exercised + and exercise + unto them which are exercised +/ . gumnazo {goom-nad'-zo}; from 1131 + Naked + 
naked + be naked + and naked + his naked + me not in naked + from them naked + things are naked + that shall be 
but bare + unto him ( for he was naked +/ ; to practise naked (in the games), i .e . train (figuratively): --exercise . 

1129 + exercise +/ . gumnasia {goom-nas-ee'-ah}; from 1128 + exercised + and exercise + unto them which are 
exercised +/ ; training, i .e . (figuratively) asceticism: --exercise . 

1467 + contain + for the mastery is temperate +/ . egkrateuomai {eng-krat-yoo'-om-ahee}; middle voice from 1468 + 
temperate +/ ; to exercise self-restraint (in diet and chastity): --can([-not]) contain, be temperate . 

1850 + authority + the power + hath not power + for me but I will not be brought + over them ; and they that exercise 
+/ . exousiazo {ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 1849 + right + power + powers + liberty + he power + not power + the power + 
own power + and power + authority + him power + them power + the powers + and powers + not my power + to the 
power + jurisdiction + and strength + not we power + of the power + we not power + him authority + and authority + 
and the power + them and power + was with power + unto you power + thou authority + with authority + and 
authorities + and their power + For their power + of our authority + us from the power + for with authority + and from 
the power + with him . And power +/ ; to control: --exercise authority upon, bring under the (have) power of . 

2292 + am bold + confident + We are confident + that we may boldly + therefore that I have confidence +/ . tharrheo 
{thar-hreh'-o}; another form for 2293 + be of good cheer + Be of good cheer + be of good comfort + but be of good 
cheer + unto them Be of good cheer + unto him Be of good comfort +/ ; to exercise courage: --be bold, X boldly, have 
confidence, be confident . Compare 5111 + Dare + bold + durst + is bold + I am bold + and durst + in boldly + that 
durst + to be bold + For we dare + would even dare + that they durst + For I will not dare +/ . 

2616 + men oppress + that were oppressed +/ . katadunasteuo {kat-ad-oo-nas-tyoo'-o}; from 2596 + after 2596- after 
2596- at + on + At + yet + own + into + over + after + where + every + about + after + it on + cause + And at + before 
+ toward + matter + Against + covered + through + against + in every + me after + my state + touching + us after + is 
after + But after + According + men after + not after + it be yet + of but on + according + and every + but after + in 
respect + Concerning + ye against + my affairs + that after + throughout + concerning + upon you on + not against + 
place every + and against + being alone + him against + as touching + that through + unto them at + things after + laid 
against + is according + it not after + we according + not ye after + and in every + particularly + it according + him 
according + you according + as concerning + and not after + not according + As concerning + for him after + man 
according + Not according + day according + but according + violently down + itself against + when he was at + can be 
against + for that after + of him through + things against + thing according + which are among + be done through + by 
you according + things according + somewhat against + that was against + unto me according + but not according + 
which is according + shall be according + of me is not after + with them according + to him out of every + one of you 
according + unto thee that after + sakes but as touching + be it unto me according + For they that are after + him that 
was born after + any thing to the charge + but they that are after + let us prophesy according + For he that is not 
against + in you and ye in him according + He that is not with me is against + him not for he that is not against +/ and 
a derivative of 1413 + Potentate + the mighty + of great authority +/ ; to exercise dominion against, i .e . oppress: --
oppress . 

2634 + over + lordship + exercise + dominion + as being lords + them and overcame +/ . katakurieuo {kat-ak-oo-ree-
yoo'-o}; from 2596 + after 2596- after 2596- at + on + At + yet + own + into + over + after + where + every + about + 
after + it on + cause + And at + before + toward + matter + Against + covered + through + against + in every + me 
after + my state + touching + us after + is after + But after + According + men after + not after + it be yet + of but on 
+ according + and every + but after + in respect + Concerning + ye against + my affairs + that after + throughout + 
concerning + upon you on + not against + place every + and against + being alone + him against + as touching + that 
through + unto them at + things after + laid against + is according + it not after + we according + not ye after + and in 
every + particularly + it according + him according + you according + as concerning + and not after + not according + 
As concerning + for him after + man according + Not according + day according + but according + violently down + 
itself against + when he was at + can be against + for that after + of him through + things against + thing according + 
which are among + be done through + by you according + things according + somewhat against + that was against + 
unto me according + but not according + which is according + shall be according + of me is not after + with them 
according + to him out of every + one of you according + unto thee that after + sakes but as touching + be it unto me 
according + For they that are after + him that was born after + any thing to the charge + but they that are after + let 
us prophesy according + For he that is not against + in you and ye in him according + He that is not with me is against 
+ him not for he that is not against +/ and 2961 + of lords + lordship + exercise + dominion + hath dominion + that he 
might be Lord + shall not have dominion + Not for that we have dominion +/ ; to lord against, i .e . control, subjugate: -
-exercise dominion over (lordship), be lord over, overcome . 

2715 + exercise + authority + ones exercise +/ . katexousiazo {kat-ex-oo-see-ad'-zo}; from 2596 + after 2596- after 
2596- at + on + At + yet + own + into + over + after + where + every + about + after + it on + cause + And at + before 
+ toward + matter + Against + covered + through + against + in every + me after + my state + touching + us after + is 
after + But after + According + men after + not after + it be yet + of but on + according + and every + but after + in 
respect + Concerning + ye against + my affairs + that after + throughout + concerning + upon you on + not against + 
place every + and against + being alone + him against + as touching + that through + unto them at + things after + laid 
against + is according + it not after + we according + not ye after + and in every + particularly + it according + him 
according + you according + as concerning + and not after + not according + As concerning + for him after + man 
according + Not according + day according + but according + violently down + itself against + when he was at + can be 
against + for that after + of him through + things against + thing according + which are among + be done through + by 
you according + things according + somewhat against + that was against + unto me according + but not according + 
which is according + shall be according + of me is not after + with them according + to him out of every + one of you 
according + unto thee that after + sakes but as touching + be it unto me according + For they that are after + him that 
was born after + any thing to the charge + but they that are after + let us prophesy according + For he that is not 
against + in you and ye in him according + He that is not with me is against + him not for he that is not against +/ and 
1850 + authority + the power + hath not power + for me but I will not be brought + over them ; and they that exercise 
+/ ; to have (wield) full privilege over: --exercise authority . 

2961 + of lords + lordship + exercise + dominion + hath dominion + that he might be Lord + shall not have dominion + 
Not for that we have dominion +/ . kurieuo {ko-ree-yoo'-o}; from 2962 + Sir + sir + Sirs + Lord + master + O Lord + 
Master + of God + Masters + My lord + my Lord + is Lord + him Sir + masters + him Lord + a Master + of lords + 
the lord + our Lord + The Lord + the Lord + His lord + OF LORDS + The lord + him Lord + and Lord + his lord + him 
lord + AND LORD + The LORD + the Lord + thou Lord + Thou Lord + and from the Lord 2962- and from the Lord 
2962- and lords + the Lord s + is he Lord + to my Lord + the owners + he is Lord + of my Lord + ye me Lord + the 
master + is it Lord + his lord s + by the Lord + as the Lord + thee O Lord + is the Lord + in our Lord + up the Lord + 
as our Lord + of our Lord + on the Lord + to the Lord + in the Lord + be the Lord + of the Lord + for my lord + her 
masters + by our Lord + as his lord + of thy lord + away my Lord + unto my lord + unto my Lord + unto me Lord + 
And the Lord + on us O Lord + and the Lord + on me O Lord + For the Lord + for the Lord + not the Lord + And the 
lord + But the Lord + and our Lord + And his lord + unto him Sir + not our Lord + that our Lord + unto him Lord + is 
the Lord s + unto the Lord + with the Lord + hath the Lord + that the Lord + upon the Lord + of the Lord s + of his 
lord s + away the Lord + And Thou Lord + from the Lord + than his lord + will the Lord + for their lord + shall the lord 
+ shall the Lord + And ye masters + ye to the Lord + It is the Lord + I am here Lord + I not the Lord + for the Lord s 
+ was the Lord s + from thee Lord + as to the Lord + me is the Lord + and of the Lord + her in the Lord + unto their 
lord + man as the Lord + things the Lord + him to the Lord + are in the Lord + and in the Lord + not to the Lord + as 
unto the Lord + fast in the Lord + unto him My Lord + be with the Lord + it unto the Lord + them to the Lord + ye 
that the Lord + but for the Lord + is with the Lord + that of the Lord + thou unto my lord + though he be lord + we are 
the Lord s + And when the Lord + her from the Lord + thing of the Lord + and from our Lord + and from the Lord + 
unto him The Lord + how that the Lord + are ye in the Lord + from their masters + they unto him Lord + following the 
Lord + unto me of the Lord + of thee in the Lord + them for he is Lord + after that the Lord + that it was the Lord + 
And when her masters + ye therefore the Lord + of us and of the Lord + unto you That the Lord + the things of the 
Lord + seeing that he is Lord + yet not I but the Lord + Notwithstanding the Lord + for the things of the Lord + even 
the words of our Lord + to them that are your masters + for the things that belong to the Lord +/ ; to rule: --have 
dominion over, lord, be lord of, exercise lordship over . 

3421 + made + mention + remember + Remember + Remembering + and remember + For ye remember + she 
remembereth + ye may remember + and to remember + hath remembered + they had been mindful + ye not and do ye 
not remember + they would that we should remember +/ . mnemoneuo {mnay-mon-yoo'-o}; from a derivative of 3420 
+ in remembrance +/ ; to exercise memory, i .e . recollect; by implication to punish; also to rehearse: --make mention; 
be mindful, remember . 

3539 + think + perceive + Consider + understand + we understand + being understood + let him understand + Do ye 
not perceive + is it that ye do not understand +/ . noieo {noy-eh'-o}; from 3563 + mind + minds + in mind + the mind + 
of my mind + their mind + is the mind + understanding + of their mind + with the mind + but my understanding + with 
my understanding + he their understanding + with the understanding + up by his fleshly mind +/ ; to exercise the mind 
(observe), i .e . (figuratively) to comprehend, heed: --consider, perceive, think, understand . 

3627 + I will have compassion + and I will have compassion +/ . oikteiro {oyk-ti'-ro}; also (in certain tenses) prolonged 
oiktereo {oyk-ter-eh'-o}; from oiktos (pity); to exercise pity: --have compassion on . 

5195 + to use + entreated + and entreated + and spitefully + them spitefully + thou reproachest + them despitefully + 
and were shamefully +/ . hubrizo {hoo-brid'-zo}; from 5196 + harm + be with hurt + in reproaches +/ ; to exercise 
violence, i .e . abuse: --use despitefully, reproach, entreat shamefully (spitefully) . 

5426 + Set + mind + care + Mind + minded + do mind + careful + to think + regardeth + let us mind + but to think + I 
understood + thou thinkest + for me to think + He that regardeth + he doth not regard + for thou savourest + in us not 
to think + and he that regardeth + that ye be likeminded + unto me for thou savourest +/ . phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 
5424 + in understanding + but in understanding +/ ; to exercise the mind, i .e . entertain or have a sentiment or 
opinion; by implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain direction); intensively, to 
interest oneself in (with concern or obedience): --set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the 
same, + let this) mind(-ed), regard, savour, think . 

5431 + might be careful +/ . phrontizo {fron-tid'-zo}; from a derivative of 5424 + in understanding + but in 
understanding +/ ; to exercise thought, i .e . be anxious: --be careful . 



Root Words and their word stems. This helps you see all related words in 
the English. 

11 * exercise 

6 - exercised 

1 - exerciseth 



English Theasurus that shows all the ways the English word is translated 
from the original Greek and Hebrew. 

exercise 1128 ** gumnazo ** {exercise}.

exercise 1129 ** gumnasia ** {exercise}.

exercise 1497 -- gazal -- catch, consume, {exercise} [robbery], pluck (off), rob,spoil, take away (by force, violence), 
tear.

exercise 1850 ** exousiazo ** {exercise} authority upon, bring under the (have) powerof.

exercise 1980 -- halak -- (all) along, apace, behave (self), come, (on) continually,be conversant, depart, + be eased, 
enter, {exercise} (self), + follow,forth, forward, get, go (about, abroad, along, away, forward, on, out, upand down), + 
greater, grow, be wont to haunt, lead, march, X more and more,move (self), needs, on, pass (away), be at the point, 
quite, run (along), +send, speedily, spread, still, surely, + tale-bearer, + travel(-ler), walk(abroad, on, to and fro, up 
and down, to places), wander, wax, [way-]faringman, X be weak, whirl.

exercise 2634 ** katakurieuo ** {exercise} dominion over (lordship), be lord over,overcome.

exercise 2715 ** katexousiazo ** {exercise} authority.

exercise 2961 ** kurieuo ** have dominion over, lord, be lord of, {exercise} lordshipover.

exercise 4160 ** poieo ** abide, + agree, appoint, X avenge, + band together, be,bear, + bewray, bring (forth), cast 
out, cause, commit, + content,continue, deal, + without any delay, (would) do(-ing), execute, {exercise},fulfil, gain, 
give, have, hold, X journeying, keep, + lay wait, + lightenthe ship, make, X mean, + none of these things move me, 
observe, ordain,perform, provide, + have purged, purpose, put, + raising up, X secure,shew, X shoot out, spend, take, 
tarry, + transgress the law, work, yield.

exercise 6031 -- \anah -- abase self, afflict(-ion, self), answer, chasten self,deal hardly with, defile, {exercise}, force, 
gentleness, humble (self),hurt, ravish, sing, submit self, weaken, X in any wise.

exercise 6213 -- \asah -- accomplish, advance, appoint, apt, be at, become, bear,bestow, bring forth, bruise, be busy, X 
certainly, have the charge of,commit, deal (with), deck, + displease, do, (ready) dress(-ed), (put in)execute(-ion), 
{exercise}, fashion, + feast, [fight-]ing man, + finish,fit, fly, follow, fulfill, furnish, gather, get, go about, govern, 
grant,great, + hinder, hold ([a feast]), X indeed, + be industrious, + journey,keep, labour, maintain, make, be meet, 
observe, be occupied, offer, +officer, pare, bring (come) to pass, perform, pracise, prepare, procure,provide, put, 
requite, X sacrifice, serve, set, shew, X sin, spend, Xsurely, take, X thoroughly, trim, X very, + vex, be [warr-]ior, 
work(-man),yield, use.



Greek Cross References that shows all the ways the Greek is translated from 
the English word. 

exercise 0778 askeo * {exercise} , {0778 askeo } , 1128 gumnazo , 1129 gumnasia , 2634 katakurieuo , 2715 
katexousiazo ,

exercise 1128 gumnazo * {exercise} , 0778 askeo , {1128 gumnazo } , 1129 gumnasia , 2634 katakurieuo , 2715 
katexousiazo ,

exercise 1129 gumnasia * {exercise} , 0778 askeo , 1128 gumnazo , {1129 gumnasia } , 2634 katakurieuo , 2715 
katexousiazo ,

exercise 2634 katakurieuo * {exercise} , 0778 askeo , 1128 gumnazo , 1129 gumnasia , {2634 katakurieuo } , 2715 
katexousiazo ,

exercise 2715 katexousiazo * {exercise} , 0778 askeo , 1128 gumnazo , 1129 gumnasia , 2634 katakurieuo , {2715 
katexousiazo } ,

exercised 1128 gumnazo * {exercised} , {1128 gumnazo } ,

exerciseth 4160 poieo * {exerciseth} , {4160 poieo } ,



English to Hebrew and Greek Thesaurus

The - is marking the Old Testament words. The * is marking the New Testament Words. English list 
of words is 15,684 * Hebrew Numbers refered to 8,674 * Greek Numbers refered to 5,624 * Unique 
English words in N.T. 5,437 * Unique English words in O.T. 10,254 

* exercise , 0778 , 1128 , 1129 , 2634 , 2715 ,

- exercise , 1980 , 6213 ,



English Synonyms with Greek Strong's Number.

exercise - 0778 {exercise},

exercise - 1128 {exercise}, exercised,

exercise - 1129 {exercise},

exercise - 2634 dominion, {exercise}, lords, lordship, over, overcame,

exercise - 2715 authority, {exercise},

exercised - 1128 exercise, {exercised},

exerciseth - 4160 abode, agree, appointed, bare, bear, been, bring, bringeth, bringing, brought, cause, caused, 
causeth, commit, committed, committeth, content, continue, did, do, doest, doeth, doing, done, execute, {exerciseth}, 
forth, fulfil, fulfilling, gave,



One Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself [rather] unto godliness.

exercise 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is profitable unto all things, having promise 
of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a conscience void of offence toward God, 
and [toward] men.

exercise 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he understandeth and knoweth me, that I [am] 
the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, in the earth: for in these [things] I delight, 
saith the LORD.

exercise 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and they 
that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and they 
that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they which are 
accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority upon them.

exercise 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they which are 
accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority upon them.

exercise 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the Gentiles 
exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the Gentiles 
exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, nor mine eyes lofty: neither 
do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercised 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from sin; beguiling unstable souls: an 
heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exercised 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] that are 
done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and exercised robbery, and have vexed the 
poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] those who by reason of use 
have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: nevertheless 
afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exerciseth 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth the earth and 
them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.



Two Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise authority 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; 
and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise authority 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they which 
are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority upon 
them.

exercise authority 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the 
Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise dominion 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the 
Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; 
and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise lordship 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they which are 
accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority upon them.

exercise lovingkindness 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he understandeth and knoweth 
me, that I [am] the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, in the earth: for in these 
[things] I delight, saith the LORD.

exercise myself 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a conscience void of offence 
toward God, and [toward] men.

exercise myself 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, nor mine eyes lofty: 
neither do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercise profiteth 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is profitable unto all things, 
having promise of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise thyself 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself [rather] unto 
godliness.

exercised in 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised robbery 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and exercised robbery, and have 
vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised thereby 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: 
nevertheless afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exercised therewith 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] 
that are done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised to 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] those who by reason of 
use have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised with 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from sin; beguiling unstable souls: 
an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exerciseth all 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth the earth 
and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.



Three Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise authority upon 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over 
them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise authority upon 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they 
which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority 
upon them.

exercise authority upon 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the 
Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise dominion over 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the 
Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over 
them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise lordship over 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they 
which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority 
upon them.

exercise lovingkindness judgment 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he understandeth and 
knoweth me, that I [am] the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, in the earth: for in 
these [things] I delight, saith the LORD.

exercise myself in 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, nor mine eyes 
lofty: neither do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercise myself to 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a conscience void of offence 
toward God, and [toward] men.

exercise profiteth little 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is profitable unto all things, 
having promise of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise thyself rather 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself [rather] unto 
godliness.

exercised in it 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised robbery and 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and exercised robbery, and 
have vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised thereby 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: 
nevertheless afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exercised therewith 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] 
that are done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised to discern 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] those who by 
reason of use have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised with covetous 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from sin; beguiling 
unstable souls: an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exerciseth all the 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth the 
earth and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.



Four Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise authority upon them 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship 
over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise authority upon them 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that 
they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise 
authority upon them.

exercise authority upon them 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes 
of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise dominion over them 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes 
of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over them 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship 
over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise lordship over them 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that 
they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise 
authority upon them.

exercise lovingkindness judgment and 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he understandeth 
and knoweth me, that I [am] the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, in the earth: for 
in these [things] I delight, saith the LORD.

exercise myself in great 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, nor mine 
eyes lofty: neither do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercise myself to have 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a conscience void of 
offence toward God, and [toward] men.

exercise profiteth little but 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is profitable unto all 
things, having promise of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise thyself rather unto 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself [rather] 
unto godliness.

exercised in it 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised robbery and have 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and exercised robbery, 
and have vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised thereby 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: 
nevertheless afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exercised therewith 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] 
that are done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised to discern both 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] those who 
by reason of use have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised with covetous practices 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from sin; 
beguiling unstable souls: an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exerciseth all the power 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth 
the earth and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.



Five Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise authority upon them are 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise 
lordship over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise authority upon them 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that 
they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise 
authority upon them.

exercise authority upon them 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes 
of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise dominion over them and 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the 
princes of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over them and 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship 
over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise lordship over them and 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that 
they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise 
authority upon them.

exercise lovingkindness judgment and righteousness 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he 
understandeth and knoweth me, that I [am] the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, 
in the earth: for in these [things] I delight, saith the LORD.

exercise myself in great matters 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, nor 
mine eyes lofty: neither do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercise myself to have always 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a conscience void 
of offence toward God, and [toward] men.

exercise profiteth little but godliness 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is profitable 
unto all things, having promise of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise thyself rather unto godliness 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself 
[rather] unto godliness.

exercised in it 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised robbery and have vexed 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and exercised 
robbery, and have vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised thereby 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: 
nevertheless afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exercised therewith 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] 
that are done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised to discern both good 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] those 
who by reason of use have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised with covetous practices cursed 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from 
sin; beguiling unstable souls: an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exerciseth all the power of 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and 
causeth the earth and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.



Six Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise authority upon them are called 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise 
lordship over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise authority upon them 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that 
they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise 
authority upon them.

exercise authority upon them 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes 
of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise dominion over them and they 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that 
the princes of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over them and their 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye 
know that they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones 
exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over them and they 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise 
lordship over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise lovingkindness judgment and righteousness in 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he 
understandeth and knoweth me, that I [am] the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, 
in the earth: for in these [things] I delight, saith the LORD.

exercise myself in great matters or 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, 
nor mine eyes lofty: neither do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercise myself to have always a 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a conscience void 
of offence toward God, and [toward] men.

exercise profiteth little but godliness is 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is profitable 
unto all things, having promise of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise thyself rather unto godliness 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself 
[rather] unto godliness.

exercised in it 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised robbery and have vexed the 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and exercised 
robbery, and have vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised thereby 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: 
nevertheless afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exercised therewith 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] 
that are done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised to discern both good and 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] 
those who by reason of use have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised with covetous practices cursed children 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot 
cease from sin; beguiling unstable souls: an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exerciseth all the power of the 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and 
causeth the earth and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.



Seven Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

exercise authority upon them are called benefactors 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the 
Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise authority upon them 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that 
they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones exercise 
authority upon them.

exercise authority upon them 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes 
of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise dominion over them and they that 40_MAT_20_25 # But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know 
that the princes of the Gentiles exercise dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over them and their great 41_MAR_10_42 # But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, 
Ye know that they which are accounted to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones 
exercise authority upon them.

exercise lordship over them and they that 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles 
exercise lordship over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

exercise lovingkindness judgment and righteousness in the 24_JER_09_24 # But let him that glorieth glory in this, 
that he understandeth and knoweth me, that I [am] the LORD which exercise lovingkindness, judgment, and 
righteousness, in the earth: for in these [things] I delight, saith the LORD.

exercise myself in great matters or in 19_PSA_131_01 # A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not 
haughty, nor mine eyes lofty: neither do I exercise myself in great matters, or in things too high for me.

exercise myself to have always a conscience 44_ACT_24_16 # And herein do I exercise myself, to have always a 
conscience void of offence toward God, and [toward] men.

exercise profiteth little but godliness is profitable 54_1TI_04_08 # For bodily exercise profiteth little: but godliness is 
profitable unto all things, having promise of the life that now is, and of that which is to come.

exercise thyself rather unto godliness 54_1TI_04_07 # But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and exercise thyself 
[rather] unto godliness.

exercised in it 21_ECC_03_10 # I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be exercised in it.

exercised robbery and have vexed the poor 26_EZE_22_29 # The people of the land have used oppression, and 
exercised robbery, and have vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully.

exercised thereby 58_HEB_12_11 # Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: 
nevertheless afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are exercised thereby.

exercised therewith 21_ECC_01_13 # And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] 
that are done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be exercised therewith.

exercised to discern both good and evil 58_HEB_05_14 # But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, 
[even] those who by reason of use have their senses exercised to discern both good and evil.

exercised with covetous practices cursed children 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot 
cease from sin; beguiling unstable souls: an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

exerciseth all the power of the first 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, 
and causeth the earth and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.
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Bible Phrases for Individual word studies 

exercise authority upon them are called benefactors 42_LUK_22_25 

exercise myself 44_ACT_24_16 

exercise myself 19_PSA_131_01 

exercise thyself 54_1TI_04_07 

exercised robbery 26_EZE_22_29 



Bible Quick Find Phrase Concordance for fast finding of phrases

exercise ^ 42_LUK_22_25 / exercise /^authority upon them are called benefactors. 

exercise ^ 41_MAR_10_42 / exercise /^authority upon them. 

exercise ^ 40_MAT_20_25 / exercise /^authority upon them. 

exercise ^ 40_MAT_20_25 / exercise /^dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them. 

exercise ^ 41_MAR_10_42 / exercise /^lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority upon them. 

exercise ^ 42_LUK_22_25 / exercise /^lordship over them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called 
benefactors. 

exercise ^ 24_JER_09_24 / exercise /^lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, in the earth: for in these [things] 
I delight, saith the LORD. 

exercise ^ 19_PSA_131_01 / exercise /^myself in great matters, or in things too high for me. 

exercise ^ 44_ACT_24_16 / exercise /^myself, to have always a conscience void of offence toward God, and [toward] 
men. 

exercise ^ 54_1TI_04_08 / exercise /^profiteth little: but godliness is profitable unto all things, having promise of the 
life that now is, and of that which is to come. 

exercise ^ 54_1TI_04_07 / exercise /^thyself [rather] unto godliness. 

exercised ^ 21_ECC_03_10 / exercised /^in it. 

exercised ^ 26_EZE_22_29 / exercised /^robbery, and have vexed the poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the 
stranger wrongfully. 

exercised ^ 58_HEB_12_11 / exercised /^thereby. 

exercised ^ 21_ECC_01_13 / exercised /^therewith. 

exercised ^ 58_HEB_05_14 / exercised /^to discern both good and evil. 

exercised ^ 61_2PE_02_14 / exercised /^with covetous practices; cursed children: 

exerciseth ^ 66_REV_13_12 / exerciseth /^all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth the earth and them 
which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed. 



Bible Translation Phrases for Individual word studies 

exercise ......... and exercise 1128 -gumnazo-> 

exercise ......... do I exercise 0778 -askeo-> 

exercise ......... exercise 1129 -gumnasia-> 

exercise ......... exercise 2634 -katakurieuo-> 

exercise ......... exercise 2715 -katexousiazo-> 

exercise ......... exercise 2961 -kurieuo-> 

exercise ......... ones exercise 2715 -katexousiazo-> 

exercise ......... over them ; and they that exercise 1850 -exousiazo-> 

exercised ......... exercised 1128 -gumnazo-> 

exercised ......... unto them which are exercised 1128 -gumnazo-> 

exerciseth ......... And he exerciseth 4160 -poieo-> 



Bible Word Index with the full text of each verse

exercise 54_1TI_04_07 But refuse profane and old wives' fables, and {exercise} thyself [rather] unto godliness. 

exercise 54_1TI_04_08 For bodily {exercise} profiteth little: but godliness is profitable unto all things, having promise 
of the life that now is, and of that which is to come. 

exercise 44_ACT_24_16 And herein do I {exercise} myself, to have always a conscience void of offence toward God, 
and [toward] men. 

exercise 24_JER_09_24 But let him that glorieth glory in this, that he understandeth and knoweth me, that I [am] the 
LORD which {exercise} lovingkindness, judgment, and righteousness, in the earth: for in these [things] I delight, saith 
the LORD. 

exercise 42_LUK_22_25 And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and they that 
{exercise} authority upon them are called benefactors. 

exercise 42_LUK_22_25 And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles {exercise} lordship over them; and they 
that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors. 

exercise 40_MAT_20_25 But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the Gentiles 
exercise dominion over them, and they that are great {exercise} authority upon them. 

exercise 40_MAT_20_25 But Jesus called them [unto him], and said, Ye know that the princes of the Gentiles 
{exercise} dominion over them, and they that are great exercise authority upon them. 

exercise 41_MAR_10_42 But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they which are accounted 
to rule over the Gentiles {exercise} lordship over them; and their great ones exercise authority upon them. 

exercise 41_MAR_10_42 But Jesus called them [to him], and saith unto them, Ye know that they which are accounted 
to rule over the Gentiles exercise lordship over them; and their great ones {exercise} authority upon them. 

exercise 19_PSA_131_01 A Song of degrees of David. LORD, my heart is not haughty, nor mine eyes lofty: neither 
do I {exercise} myself in great matters, or in things too high for me. 

exercised 21_ECC_01_13 And I gave my heart to seek and search out by wisdom concerning all [things] that are 
done under heaven: this sore travail hath God given to the sons of man to be {exercised} therewith. 

exercised 61_2PE_02_14 Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from sin; beguiling unstable souls: an 
heart they have {exercised} with covetous practices; cursed children: 

exercised 21_ECC_03_10 I have seen the travail, which God hath given to the sons of men to be {exercised} in it. 

exercised 58_HEB_05_14 But strong meat belongeth to them that are of full age, [even] those who by reason of use 
have their senses {exercised} to discern both good and evil. 

exercised 26_EZE_22_29 The people of the land have used oppression, and {exercised} robbery, and have vexed the 
poor and needy: yea, they have oppressed the stranger wrongfully. 

exercised 58_HEB_12_11 Now no chastening for the present seemeth to be joyous, but grievous: nevertheless 
afterward it yieldeth the peaceable fruit of righteousness unto them which are {exercised} thereby. 

exerciseth 66_REV_13_12 And he {exerciseth} all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth the earth and 
them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed. 



Bible Word Index with Strong's Number with the full text of each verse

exercise ^ 40_MAT_20_25 But <1161> Jesus <2424> called <4341> (5666) them <0846> unto him, and said <2036> 
(5627), Ye know <1492> (5758) that <3754> the princes <0758> of the Gentiles <1484> {exercise} dominion over 
<2634> (5719) them <0846>, and <2532> they that are great <3173> exercise authority upon <2715> (5719) them 
<0846>. 

exercise ^ 40_MAT_20_25 But <1161> Jesus <2424> called <4341> (5666) them <0846> unto him, and said <2036> 
(5627), Ye know <1492> (5758) that <3754> the princes <0758> of the Gentiles <1484> exercise dominion over 
<2634> (5719) them <0846>, and <2532> they that are great <3173> {exercise} authority upon <2715> (5719) them 
<0846>. 

exercise ^ 44_ACT_24_16 And <1161> herein <1722> <5129> do I {exercise} <0778> (5719) myself <0846>, to have 
<2192> (5721) always <1275> a conscience <4893> void of offence <0677> toward <4314> God <2316>, and <2532> 
toward men <0444>. 

exercise ^ 41_MAR_10_42 But <1161> Jesus <2424> called <4341> (5666) them <0846> to him, and saith <3004> 
(5719) unto them <0846>, Ye know <1492> (5758) that <3754> they which are accounted <1380> (5723) to rule 
<0757> (5721) over the Gentiles <1484> {exercise} lordship <2634> (5719) over them <0846>; and <2532> their 
<0846> great ones <3173> exercise authority <2715> (5719) upon them <0846>. 

exercise ^ 54_1TI_04_08 For <1063> bodily <4984> {exercise} <1129> profiteth <2076> (5748) <5624> little <4314> 
<3641>: but <1161> godliness <2150> is <2076> (5748) profitable <5624> unto <4314> all things <3956>, having 
<2192> (5723) promise <1860> of the life <2222> that now is <3568>, and <2532> of that which is to come <3195> 
(5723). 

exercise ^ 42_LUK_22_25 And <1161> he said <2036> (5627) unto them <0846>, The kings <0935> of the Gentiles 
<1484> exercise lordship over <2961> (5719) them <0846>; and <2532> they that {exercise} authority upon <1850> 
(5723) them <0846> are called <2564> (5743) benefactors <2110>. 

exercise ^ 41_MAR_10_42 But <1161> Jesus <2424> called <4341> (5666) them <0846> to him, and saith <3004> 
(5719) unto them <0846>, Ye know <1492> (5758) that <3754> they which are accounted <1380> (5723) to rule 
<0757> (5721) over the Gentiles <1484> exercise lordship <2634> (5719) over them <0846>; and <2532> their 
<0846> great ones <3173> {exercise} authority <2715> (5719) upon them <0846>. 

exercise ^ 42_LUK_22_25 And <1161> he said <2036> (5627) unto them <0846>, The kings <0935> of the Gentiles 
<1484> {exercise} lordship over <2961> (5719) them <0846>; and <2532> they that exercise authority upon <1850> 
(5723) them <0846> are called <2564> (5743) benefactors <2110>. 

exercise ^ 54_1TI_04_07 But <1161> refuse <3868> (5737) profane <0952> and <2532> old wives <1126> fables 
<3454>, and <1161> {exercise} <1128> (5720) thyself <4572> rather unto <4314> godliness <2150>. 

exercised ^ 61_2PE_02_14 Having <2192> (5723) eyes <3788> full <3324> of adultery <3428>, and <2532> that 
cannot cease from <0180> sin <0266>; beguiling <1185> (5723) unstable <0793> souls <5590>: an heart <2588> they 
have <2192> (5723) {exercised} <1128> (5772) with covetous practices <4124>; cursed <2671> children <5043>: 

exercised ^ 58_HEB_05_14 But <1161> strong <4731> meat <5160> belongeth to them that are <2076> (5748) of full 
age <5046>, even those who by reason <1223> of use <1838> have <2192> (5723) their senses <0145> {exercised} 
<1128> (5772) to <4314> discern <1253> both <5037> good <2570> and <2532> evil <2556>. 

exercised ^ 58_HEB_12_11 Now <1161> no <3956> <3756> chastening <3809> for <4314> <3303> the present 
<3918> (5752) seemeth <1380> (5719) to be <1511> (5750) joyous <5479>, but <0235> grievous <3077>: 
nevertheless <1161> afterward <5305> it yieldeth <0591> (5719) the peaceable <1516> fruit <2590> of righteousness 
<1343> unto them which are {exercised} <1128> (5772) thereby <1223> <0846>. 

exerciseth ^ 66_REV_13_12 And <2532> he {exerciseth} <4160> (5719) all <3956> the power <1849> of the first 
<4413> beast <2342> before <1799> him <0846>, and <2532> causeth <4160> (5719) the earth <1093> and <2532> 
them which dwell <2730> (5723) therein <1722> <0846> to <2443> worship <4352> (5661) the first <4413> beast 
<2342>, whose <3739> <0846> deadly <2288> wound <4127> was healed <2323> (5681). 
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exercise 54_1TI_04_07 But refuse (3868 -paraiteomai -) profane (0952 -bebelos -) and old (1126 -graodes -) wives 
(1126 -graodes -) fables (3454 -muthos -) , and {exercise} (1128 -gumnazo -) thyself (4572 -seautou -) [ rather ] unto 
godliness (2150 -eusebeia -) . 

exercise 54_1TI_04_08 For bodily (4984 -somatikos -) {exercise} (1129 -gumnasia -) profiteth (5624 -ophelimos -) 
little (3641 -oligos -):but godliness (2150 -eusebeia -) is profitable (5624 -ophelimos -) unto all (3956 -pas -) things , 
having (2192 -echo -) promise (1860 -epaggelia -) of the life (2222 -zoe -) that now (3568 -nun -) is , and of that which is 
to come (3195 -mello -) . 

exercise 44_ACT_24_16 And herein (5129 -toutoi -) do I {exercise} (0778 -askeo -) myself , to have (2192 -echo -) 
always (1275 -diapantos -) a conscience (4893 -suneidesis -) void (0677 -aproskopos -) of offence (0677 -aproskopos -) 
toward (4314 -pros -) God (2316 -theos -) , and [ toward ] men (0444 -anthropos -) . 

exercise 24_JER_09_24 But let him that glorieth (01984 +halal ) glory (01984 +halal ) in this (02063 +zo)th ) , that he 
understandeth (07919 +sakal ) and knoweth (03045 +yada( ) me , that I [ am ] the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) which 
{exercise} (06213 +(asah ) lovingkindness (02617 +checed ) , judgment (04941 +mishpat ) , and righteousness (06666 
+ts@daqah ) , in the earth (00776 +)erets ):for in these (00428 +)el - leh ) [ things ] I delight (02654 +chaphets ) , saith 
(05002 +n@)um ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

exercise 42_LUK_22_25 And he said 2036 -epo - unto them , The kings 0935 -basileus - of the Gentiles 1484 -ethnos 
- exercise 2961 -kurieuo - lordship 2961 -kurieuo - over them ; and they that {exercise} 1850 -exousiazo - authority 
1850 -exousiazo - upon them are called 2564 -kaleo - benefactors 2110 -euergetes - . 

exercise 42_LUK_22_25 And he said 2036 -epo - unto them , The kings 0935 -basileus - of the Gentiles 1484 -ethnos 
- {exercise} 2961 -kurieuo - lordship 2961 -kurieuo - over them ; and they that exercise 1850 -exousiazo - authority 
1850 -exousiazo - upon them are called 2564 -kaleo - benefactors 2110 -euergetes - . 

exercise 41_MAR_10_42 But Jesus (2424 -Iesous -) called (4341 -proskaleomai -) them [ to him ] , and saith (3004 -
lego -) unto them , Ye know (1492 -eido -) that they which are accounted (1380 -dokeo -) to rule (0757 -archo -) over 
the Gentiles (1484 -ethnos -) exercise (2634 -katakurieuo -) lordship (2634 -katakurieuo -) over them ; and their great 
(3173 -megas -) ones {exercise} (2715 -katexousiazo -) authority (2715 -katexousiazo -) upon them . 

exercise 41_MAR_10_42 But Jesus (2424 -Iesous -) called (4341 -proskaleomai -) them [ to him ] , and saith (3004 -
lego -) unto them , Ye know (1492 -eido -) that they which are accounted (1380 -dokeo -) to rule (0757 -archo -) over 
the Gentiles (1484 -ethnos -) {exercise} (2634 -katakurieuo -) lordship (2634 -katakurieuo -) over them ; and their 
great (3173 -megas -) ones exercise (2715 -katexousiazo -) authority (2715 -katexousiazo -) upon them . 

exercise 40_MAT_20_25 But Jesus (2424 -Iesous -) called (4341 -proskaleomai -) them [ unto him ] , and said (2036 -
epo -) , Ye know (1492 -eido -) that the princes (0758 -archon -) of the Gentiles (1484 -ethnos -) exercise (2634 -
katakurieuo -) dominion (2634 -katakurieuo -) over them , and they that are great (3171 -megalos -) {exercise} (2715 -
katexousiazo -) authority (2715 -katexousiazo -) upon them . 

exercise 40_MAT_20_25 But Jesus (2424 -Iesous -) called (4341 -proskaleomai -) them [ unto him ] , and said (2036 -
epo -) , Ye know (1492 -eido -) that the princes (0758 -archon -) of the Gentiles (1484 -ethnos -) {exercise} (2634 -
katakurieuo -) dominion (2634 -katakurieuo -) over them , and they that are great (3171 -megalos -) exercise (2715 -
katexousiazo -) authority (2715 -katexousiazo -) upon them . 

exercise 19_PSA_131_01 . A Song (07892 +shiyr ) of degrees (04609 +ma(alah ) of David (01732 +David ) . LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) , my heart (03820 +leb ) is not haughty (01361 +gabahh ) , nor (03808 +lo) ) mine eyes (05869 +
(ayin ) lofty (07311 +ruwm ):neither (03808 +lo) ) do I {exercise} (01980 +halak ) myself in great (01419 +gadowl ) 
matters (01419 +gadowl ) , or in things too high (06381 +pala) ) for me . 

exercised 61_2PE_02_14 Having (2192 -echo -) eyes (3788 -ophthalmos -) full (3324 -mestos -) of adultery (3428 -
moichalis -) , and that cannot (0180 -akatapaustos -) cease (0180 -akatapaustos -) from sin (0266 -hamartia -) ; 
beguiling (1185 -deleazo -) unstable (0793 -asteriktos -) souls (5590 -psuche -):an heart (2588 -kardia -) they have 
(2192 -echo -) {exercised} (1128 -gumnazo -) with covetous (4124 -pleonexia -) practices ; cursed (2671 -katara -) 
children (5043 -teknon -) : 

exercised 21_ECC_01_13 And I gave (05414 +nathan ) my heart (03820 +leb ) to seek (01875 +darash ) and search 
(08446 +tuwr ) out by wisdom (02451 +chokmah ) concerning (05921 +(al ) all (03605 +kol ) [ things ] that are done 
(06466 +pa(al ) under (08478 +tachath ) heaven (08064 +shamayim ):this (01931 +huw) ) sore (07451 +ra( ) travail 
(06045 +(inyan ) hath God (00430 +)elohiym ) given (05414 +nathan ) to the sons (01121 +ben ) of man (00120 +)
adam ) to be {exercised} (06031 +(anah ) therewith . 

exercised 21_ECC_03_10 I have seen (07200 +ra)ah ) the travail (06045 +(inyan ) , which (00834 +)aher ) God (00430 
+)elohiym ) hath given (05414 +nathan ) to the sons (01121 +ben ) of men (00120 +)adam ) to be {exercised} (06031 +
(anah ) in it . 

exercised 26_EZE_22_29 The people (05971 +(am ) of the land (00776 +)erets ) have used oppression (06233 +
(osheq ) , and {exercised} robbery (01498 +gazel ) , and have vexed (03238 +yanah ) the poor (06041 +(aniy ) and 
needy (34):yea , they have oppressed (06231 +(ashaq ) the stranger (01616 +ger ) wrongfully . 

exercised 58_HEB_05_14 But strong (4731 -stereos -) meat (5160 -trophe -) belongeth (1510 -eimi -) to them that are 
of full (5046 -teleios -) age (5046 -teleios -) , [ even ] those (3588 -ho -) who by reason (1223 -dia -) of use (1838 -hexis 
-) have (2192 -echo -) their senses (0145 -aistheterion -) {exercised} (1128 -gumnazo -) to discern (1253 -diakrisis -) 
both (5037 -te -) good (2570 -kalos -) and evil (2556 -kakos -) . 

exercised 58_HEB_12_11 Now (1161 -de -) no (3756 -ou -) chastening (3809 -paideia -) for the present (3918 -pareimi 
-) seemeth (1380 -dokeo -) to be joyous (5479 -chara -) , but grievous (3077 -lupe -):nevertheless (1161 -de -) 
afterward (5305 -husteron -) it yieldeth (0591 -apodidomi -) the peaceable (1516 -eirenikos -) fruit (2590 -karpos -) of 
righteousness (1343 -dikaiosune -) unto them which are {exercised} (1128 -gumnazo -) thereby (0846 -autos -) . 

exerciseth 66_REV_13_12 And he {exerciseth} (4160 -poieo -) all (3956 -pas -) the power (1849 -exousia -) of the first 
(4413 -protos -) beast (2342 -therion -) before (1799 -enopion -) him , and causeth (4160 -poieo -) the earth (1093 -ge -) 
and them which dwell (2730 -katoikeo -) therein (0846 -autos -) to worship (4352 -proskuneo -) the first (4413 -protos -
) beast (2342 -therion -) , whose (3739 -hos -) deadly (2288 -thanatos -) wound (4127 -plege -) was healed (2323 -
therapeuo -) . 

Please browse and find lots of Bible studies prepared for you. 

60 plus Media Bible Products eBibleProductions.com

http://www.ebibleproductions.com/

